
                                 CALENDAR FOR THE WEEK	 	 	 	 	 

	 	 


Sunday, October 8           	   9:00 a.m. 		 Devotional Service (In-Person & Online)                                        

                                                 9:30 a.m. 		 Fellowship (Fellowship Hall) 

                                            	 10:00 a.m. 		 Family Service (Family Chapel & Zoom) 

	 10:00 a.m.        Adult Sunday School (In-Person & Zoom)

                                               	10:00 a.m. 		 Choir Rehearsal (Sanctuary) 

                                                11:00 a.m. 		 Worship Service (In-Person & Online) 

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 Fellowship Following (Fellowship Hall) 

	 	   		 	 

Monday, October 9           	   5:30 p.m.	 	 Karate (Fellowship Hall)

	   6:00 p.m.	 	 Seaside Singers Rehearsal (Sanctuary)


Tuesday, October 10	  7:30 a.m.	 	 Jerry Dillon Men’s Breakfast Group

                                              10:00 a.m.	 	 Miriam-Naomi Circle (Library)

                                                                    	 	 	                                               	 	 

Wednesday, October 11	 10:00 a.m.	 	 AA (Upstairs)	 

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 

Thursday, October 12	  5:30 p.m.	 	 Karate (Fellowship Hall)

	  6:00 p.m.	 	 Choir Practice 

	 	 	 	  

Friday, October 13                  12:30 p.m.		 Bridge (Fellowship Hall)

	 

Sunday, October 15           	   9:00 a.m. 		 Devotional Service (In-Person & Online) 

	   9:00 a.m.	 	 Growing Faith (Upstairs Classroom)                                       

                                                 9:30 a.m. 		 Fellowship (Fellowship Hall) 

                                            	 10:00 a.m. 		 Family Service (Family Chapel & Zoom) 

	 10:00 a.m.        Adult Sunday School (In-Person & Zoom)

                                               	10:00 a.m. 		 Choir Rehearsal (Sanctuary) 

                                                11:00 a.m. 		 Worship Service (In-Person & Online) 

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 Fellowship Following (Fellowship Hall) 

	  3:00 p.m.	 	 Girl Scouts (Fellowship Hall)
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Announcements

Week of October 8, 2023


Cents Ability is collected in the bowl in the Narthex this Sunday. Thanks to you, 
donations have been made to Neighbors Together, East Cooper Meals on Wheels, and East 
Cooper Community Outreach. Please continue to give at least two cents per person per 
meal in the bowl in the Narthex on the 2nd Sunday of each month. This simple act is an 
expression of thanksgiving for what we have received.

We’re extending Ecco Sunday Grocery Bags another week.  They will be due back 
Sunday, October 15th. Filled grocery bags may be returned to the Narthex or in the bin 
outside the Fellowship Hall doors. Each month, ECCO relies on donations from 
community members, civic organizations, businesses, churches, and neighborhoods. 
Thank you for your generous donations!


The Miriam-Naomi Circle will meet October 10th at 10 am in the Library as we continue 
our study book Romans Learner Session Guide: Books of Faith by Matthew J. Marohl. We 
welcome new participants in the Circle.  If you have any questions or if you would like to 
be added to our mailing list, please call Patsy Hindman at (843) 906-8653.


A New Member Class is scheduled for Sunday morning, October 15th.  If you’re 
intersted in becoming a part of the Sunrise family or learning more about Sunrise 
Presbyterian Church, please contact the church office at hello@oursunrise.org or 
843.883.3888 and we’ll be in touch with you.


The Women’s Evening Bible Study will meet October 17th at 5:30 pm. We will continue 
our Bible study with the book PHILIPPIANS by N. T. Wright. We’ll meet at the church 
and via Zoom. -Reece 

Sunrise Columbarium and Memorial Garden: Your Final Resting Place

Sunrise is evaluating the establishment of a columbarium and memorial garden. Where 
would you like to be laid to rest: in a cemetery where you have rarely or never set foot, or 
at Sunrise where you have developed a sense of belonging and community? The 
columbarium and memorial garden on our church property would allow for complete 
ministry to our congregation, from baptism to burial. It would be a reminder that while our 
physical lives will end, our spiritual lives will have a new beginning. For additional 
information, contact Ida Havelka at ihavelka@comcast.net or at 843-412-1884 or Bob 
Havelka at rhavelka@comcast.net or at 843-412-1908.
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